Message

From: Evans, Paul [/O=CELOTEX LTD/OU=EXCHANGE ADMINISTRATIVE GROUP
(FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/CN=RECIPIENTS/CN=PEVANS]

Sent: 27/08/2013 21:49:02

To: Mahoney, Joe [jmahoney@celotex.co.uk]

CC: Roper, Jonathan [jroper@celotex.co.uk]

Subject: Re: Invoice

Still awaiting green light from fire consultant that the FR range will have a good chance of passing the test. What we
have paid the £1000 so far for.

Once we have this confirmation we will begin designing the test rig and overall system and book the rig with BRE. At
this point we will need to pay for the main test. Best estimate as it sits today is this will be an October spend with
test sometime in November.

Jon will provide more detail when he returns from holidays w/c 9th September.

Cheers
Paul

Sent from my iPad

On 27 Aug 2013, at 15:20, "Mahoney, Joe" <jmahoney@_celotex.co.uk> wrote:
This may be the answer to my previous email.

Yes I have £25k left if you ask nicely enough!
When do you need it?

Joe

Joe Mahoney
Development Manager

Mobile:

Extension:

Email: jmahoney@celotex.co.uk
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Paul Evans
Head of Marketing
Mobile: N

Extension: %
Email: pevans@celotex.co.uk
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From: Roper, Jonathan
Sent: 14 August 2013 16:14
To: Mahoney, Joe

Subject: FW: Invoice

Joe,

As discussed can you pass on a budget code and signature for the above invoice. We'll also be
receiving a futher invoice for consultancy fees of circa £300 within the next week to settle too.

PE was keen to look to fund above 18m testing ourselves if the finance was available from your NPD
budget. As you'll be on holiday from tomorrow, can you indicate whether or not there is £25k left for
the remainder of this year to cover above 18m subject to our consultant giving us the green light
within the next 5 days.

Any questions, give me a call.

Thanks

Jonathan Roper

Assistant Product Manager
Mobile: 'g
Extension:

Email: jroper@celotex.co.uk

<image529ecf JPG>

<image8d04ae.GIF> Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail

From: Racheal Edwards [ mailto:Racheal. Edwards@ifcgroup.com]
Sent: 14 August 2013 11:37

To: Roper, Jonathan

Subject: Invoice

Dear Jonathon

Please see the attached copy of invoice L894945 dated 31/07/13.

The original copy has been posted.

Many Thanks

Racheal Edwards

Produced on behalf of Celotex Limited
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Accounts Assistant
International Fire Consultants Ltd. (IFC)
A member of the IFC Group of Companies

Tel:
E-mail: racheal.edwards@ifcgroup.com
Web: www.ifcgroup.com
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Head & Registered Office: 20 Park Street, Princes Risborough, Buckinghamshire, England, HP27 SAH
International Fire Consultants Ltd. is a company registered in England & Wales, Company No. 2194010
IFC Certification Ltd. is a company registered in England & Wales Company No. 4777898

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail and any attachments are CONFIDENTIAL and may contain legally privileged information. If you are not
the intended recipient of this e-mail message, please telephone or e-mail us immediately, delete this message from your system and do
not read, copy, distribute, disclose or otherwise use this e-mail message and any attachments.

Disclaimer: Although the IFC Group believes this e-mail and any attachments to be free of any virus or other defect which may affect
your computer, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and the IFC Group does not accept any responsibility
for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
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