GRENFELL TOWER INQUIRY

EXHIBIT JD/6 TO SECOND WITNESS STATEMENT OF JENNY BEATRICE
DAINTON

Jenny Beatrice Dainton
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From: Miller, Jessica: CS-FamServ: RBKC <Jessica.Miller@rbkc.gov.uk>

Sent: Tuesday, August 8, 2017 5:47:42 PM

To: Jenny Dainton

Cc: Zoe Dainton

Subject: RE: 12 Grenfell Tower - Jenny Dainton, Zoe Dainton and Leah Weekes

Hi Jenny,

Thanks for the email. | do apologise for the delay in getting this to you. This time, and going
forward | will make the request two or three days earlier than when the expenses cover. So
your next expenses cover from 10" August for two weeks, and this should have been
received today after 4pm. | will continue to do this so that we can ensure when you do not
receive it there is a couple of days when we can resolve it.

If you have any further questions or if you do not receive it again please let me know and
apologies for this.

Thanks,

Jessica Miller

From: Jenny Dainton [

Sent: 05 August 2017 17:24

To: Miller, Jessica: CS-FamServ: RBKC <Jessica.Miller@rbkc.gov.uk>

Cc: Zoe Dainton

Subject: Fwd: 12 Grenfell Tower - Jenny Dainton, Zoe Dainton and Leah Weekes

Hi Jessica,

I hope you are well

I know there were some delays regarding the payments for our food allowance. As Zoe
confirmed we did all eventually receive a payment at the end of last week, thank you for
chasing that up.

I am aware this delay was not caused by you but would you please feedback the importance
of us receiving these payments on time at the beginning of the week because we are totally
dependant on these payments to buy our meals as the hotel food is of a very poor standard.

Thank you once again for your help.

Jenny, Zoe and Leah

Begin forwarded message:

From: Jenny Dainton

Subject: Re: 12 Grenfell Tower - Jenny Dainton, Zoe Dainton and Leah Weekes
Date: 31 July 2017 at 11:26:14 BST

To: "Miller, Jessica: CS-FamServ: RBKC" <Jessica.Miller@rbkc.gov.uk>

Hello Jessica,
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I hope you had a good weekend.
Last week neither me or Leah received the £300 food allowance.

Zoe received her allowance but me and Leah are still waiting. I checked my bank account
again this morning but there is still no payment.

Would you please be able to look into this for us as soon as possible, the hotel menu is very
limited and unhealthy with only a couple of vegetarian options.

Many thanks,

Jenny and Leah
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