
From: 

Sent: 

To: 

Subject: 

25 May 20d6 21:59 

Re: rebate enquiry 

hi Judith as you will know it,s been some time since I e-mailed you about the rebate I am due but the tmo are holding 
onto I wondered if you had contact with them concerning this matier 

..... Orig 
From: Judith Blakeman ¯ 
To: hillfa~Tndan. 
Sent: Mon, 2 May 2016 19:14 
Subject: RE: rebate enquiry 

Dear Mr. Griffin 

I apologise for the delay in replying to you and am writing to let you know that I have put in an enquiry to the TMO 
about your heating and hot water rebate. 

I shall let you know when I receive a reply. 

Kind regards. 

CIIr Judith Blakeman 

Subject: rebate enquiry 

Dear CIIr blakeman my name is danny griffin I live at 31 ,grenfell tower, i have e mailed you before with concern’s 
regarding the work;s that have been going on in the block,however I now find my-self having to contact yourself again 
in regard;s to a rebate I should have received from the tmo.i think most of the resident;s in Grenfell tower have been 
charged more than they should have been for heating and hot water,i live in a one bedroom flat so for my flat I was 
owed a total of 
£1675.09 this was paid into my rent account on the 10/03/16.we then had the chance to leave this money in our rent 
account or have a           ~aid in to our ersonal acoounl s I chose to have mine paid into my own a ocount,~ 

on the 17/03 16 I signed a letter asking for the 
remainder to be paid into my account I was told it may take up to eight week;s to complete that was fine.on Thursday 
of this week I spoke to dion wilk;s she now inform’s me that the management are going to keep one month,s rent out 
what I am entitled too,there is know were in the rent agreement that we have to have a month,s rent in advance,i paid 
back what I owed the tmo but they do not want to give me my own money back,i really belive this is unlawfull and that 
the tmo can not just alter agreement,s when it suit,s themselves a.tier all this money was taken wrongfully in the first 
place, would you please see if I have a valid case to get all of the remaining money back 
many thanks dan griffin 
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